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Scott Lawrence

From: Paul Rowe~
Sent: " 12 October 2021 11:32

To: Scott Lawrence-
Subject: Re: Jungle Bar
Attachments: image001.png
Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Hi Scott | will pay the annual license fee personally. Is the bar trading on a daily basis?

I'm in Italy at the moment.i fly back tonight but land in manchester so travel back to the North East Wednesday I'm
meeting John Thursday, John has indicated he wants to keep the licence .

Regards
Paul Rowe

On Tue, 12 Oct 2021, 12:27 Scott Lawrence, <Scott.Lawrence @sunderland.gov.uk> wrote:

Thanks Paul,
Would you be able to update me as soon as possible.

It's important that you understand that all the incidents, together with the failure to comply with licence conditions
and failure to pay the annual fee is responsibility of both yourself and John.

We are expecting a review of the licence in a matter of days and the licence will be reviewed at the Licensing
Committee, where consideration will be given to revoke the Premises Licence.

Would you be able to confirm that following your email yesterday if it is your wish to formally surrender your
responsibilities as the licence holder?

Regards

Scott Lawrence

Senior Licensing Officer



